
ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTS

AC-1

6-8 Weeks

AC-2

6-8 Weeks

SC-9

6-8 Weeks

TA-11

6-8 Weeks

$17,136.57 $15,923.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15,923.00

Item Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

Lego Discovery Table

Low Bid is Basis of Design

Train Discovery Table

Maker Storage Table

Maker Flex Table w/ Adjustable 
Height and Nesting Base

Section Total



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

LS-15

$3,317.84

(4-6 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime)

EKO Swagr Chair 
$3,705.48 

(6 Weeks/Lifetime)

EKO Swagr Chair 
$3,668.17 

(6-8 Weeks/Lifetime)

Low Bid is Basis of Design

$3,317.84 $3,705.48 $3,668.17 $3,317.84

LT-1

$1,119.19 

(4-6 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime)

Global Zira Lectern 
$358.19 

(5-6 Weeks/Lifetime)

Three-H Unite Lectern 
$1,512.50

(8 Weeks/Lifetime)

Global Zira Does Not Meet Spec

Vinyl Film finish instead of Plasitic Laminate

No Cable Management

$1,119.19 $358.19 $1,512.50 $1,119.19

SC-1

$1,972.01 Global Zira Buffet 
Credenza  $856.65
(Too Low - 29.5"H) 

(5-6 Weeks/Lifetime)

Kimball Stow Credenza 

$1,057.34 (36"H) 
(6-7 Weeks/Lifetime)

Global Zira Does Not Meet Spec

Vinyl Film finish instead of Plasitic Laminate

Unit is 6" shorter than BOD reducing storage capacity

$1,972.01 $856.75 $1,057.34 $1,972.01
$6,409.04 NO BID $4,920.32 $6,238.01  $7,691.17 $7,237.26 NO BID $6,409.04
$4,437.03 NO BID $0.00 $1,057.34  0.00 0.00 NO BID $5,494.37

LS-9

(6-8 Weeks/ 5 Yr) HAY About A Lounge Low 
Back (14 1/8"SH, COM's 
not available - Limited 

Uph.options)
(6-8 Weeks/2 Yr) 

Muuto Fiber Lounge Chair 
(15"SH, COM's not 

available - Limited Uph 
options)

(8-10 weeks/5 Yr) 

Actual Bid Amount should 
have been $9,566.19

Lower Bids Do Not Meet Spec

Does Not Provide Specified Fabric

Configuration of Arms and Seat Height is Undesireable

Muuto Item is more of an Upholstered Side Chair rather than 

a Low Lounge Chair

Pigott Item is Only 2 yr Warrenty

$8,629.35 NO BID $4,990.32 $5,759.22  $9,415.69 $9,379.92 $643.81 $8,629.35

Rock

Sub-Section Total

Aware Lectern

Sub-Section Total

Section Total

Aware Buffet Credenza

Sub- Section Total
Section Total

Recommended Award
Section 10 - Bernhardt Design

Chiara.02 Lounge Chair

Section 9 - Allsteel



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

LS-7

National Fringe 90° Inside 
Wedge 2-Seat Lounge 
(Narrower than BOD, 

18.5”SH and the overall 
height is 40-1/4”) 

(5-6 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime)

Global River Inside Curve 

(Verify dimensions - 
18"SH) 

(5-6 Weeks/Lifetime)

(8-10 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime - 12Yr)

LS-8

National Fringe 1-Seat 
Lounge 

Global River 2 Seat Sofa (8-10 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime - 12Yr)

LS-19

Global Lounge Chair 
(Overall dimensions w/ LS-
20 substitution is too wide 

for room)

(8-10 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime - 12Yr)

LS-20

Rect. End Table (Laminate 
End Table instead of Arms - 

15”W x 26.5”D x 17”H - 
lower than seat)

(8-10 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime - 12Yr)

$18,112.63 NO BID $14,560.13 $39,751.19  $25,851.52 $22,912.49 $22,042.03 $22,042.03
$2,965.54

$18,112.63 NO BID $17,525.67 $39,751.19  $25,851.52 $22,912.49 $22,042.03 $22,042.03

Section 11A - Coalesse

Circa 60° Inside Wedge 2-Seat 
Lounge

Low Bid Substitution is Recommended

Adjustment to Bid has been made to create a better mathc to 

BOD seating capacity

Circa Straight 2-Seat Lounge

Circa Straight 2-Seat Lounge 

National Fringe Straight 3-
Seat Lounge (Arms not 

included)

Circa Straight Armrest-End-of-Run 
with Two Legs

Sub-Totals
Scope Adjustment Adds

Section Total



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

LS-13

National Fringe High Back 
(47-1/2”W x 18.5”SH and 
the overall height is 53-

1/4”)
(5-6 Weeks/Limited 

Lifetime)

Global River Extended 
High Back 2 Seat Sofa 

(48.5"W x 18"SH, overall 
height is 47")

(5-6 Weeks/Lifetime)

Davis Radius Meeting - 
Straight Lounge 

(11-12 Weeks/ 5 Yr)

ERG - Malibu 48" Straight 
Module (Includes 

48"H.privacy panel back 
(6-7 Weeks/10yr)

HPFI Eve Series (19.5"SH, 
overall height is 48") 

(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

(8-10 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime - 12Yr)

LS-14

National Fringe Straight 3-
Seat Lounge 

(70-3/4”W x 18.5”SH and 
the overall height 40-1/4”)

(5-6 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime)

Global River Lounge Chair 
(5-6 Weeks/Lifetime)

Davis Radius Meeting - 
Three Seat Lounge

(11-12 Weeks/ 5 Yr)

ERG - Malibu 22" Straight 
Module (9" inches narrower 

than basis-of-design, 
18"SH, overall height is 

33")
(6-7 Weeks/10yr)

HPFI Eve Series (Few 
inches narrower than basis-
of-design, 19.5"SH, overall 

height is 33") 
(6 Weeks/ Limited 

Lifetime)

(8-10 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime - 12Yr)

$13,242.00 NO BID $13,979.77 $15,563.42 $12,248.75 $12,195.11 $18,121.03 $18,121.03

Section 11B - Coalesse

Circa Straight 2-Seat Lounge with 
Screen

Low Bid Item from Triplett does not meet BOD

BOD has a removable back that allows users to adjust views 

through the room

ERG Item from Storey Kenworthy provides this functionality 

similar to BOD

Circa Straight 1-Seat Lounge

Section Total



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

TA-5

Allsteel Recharge Personal 
Table

$1,187.80
(4-6 Weeks/Limited 

Lifetime)

Herman Miller Plex
$890.72 (17"Dia.)
(25 Days/12 Yr)

Knoll Toboggan Table
$1,234.72

(5 Weeks/12 Yr)

Allsteel - Recharge Laptop 
Table

$1,172.69

(5-6 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime)

Haworth Pip Table $990.08 
(Painted MDF Top)

(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

$1,570.08
(8 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

TA-6

Allsteel Recharge Work 
Table

$1,199.54 
(4-6 Weeks/Limited 

Lifetime)

Global Swap
$1,553.92

(5-6 Weeks/Lifetime)

OFS - Nineteen20 48"x30" 
Table 

$1,447.56
(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

OFS - Nineteen20 48"x30" 
Table

$1,107.75
(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

Haworth Jive Table 
$806.36 (36"H, Disc Base)
(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

$2,596.30
(8 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

TA-9

Allsteel Merge Cafe Table
$1,669.75

(4-6 Weeks/ Limited 
Lifetime)

Global Swap
$2,312.65

(5-6 Weeks/Lifetime)

OFS - Nineteen20 36" 
Round Table

$2,461.80
(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

OFS - Nineteen20 36" 
Round Table

$2,466.97
(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

Haworth Jive Table 
$1,826.60  

(29"H, Disc Base)
(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

$3,505.00
(8 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

$4,057.09 NO BID $4,757.29 $5,144.08  $3,942.69 $3,623.04 $7,671.38 $7,671.38

BE-1 

(13-14 Weeks/5 Yr) Low Bid is Basis of Design

$4,044.26 NO BID $3,437.35 $3,354.85 $3,353.63 NO BID $3,357.24 $3,353.63

Low Bid Substitution is Recommended

Lagunitas Work Table

Montara650 Cafe Table

Section Total
Section 12 - Davis

Prat Bench

Section Total

Section 11C - Coalesse

Lagunitas Personal Table



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

AC-6 (1-2 Weeks/ 30 Days)

AC-7 (1-2 Weeks/ 30 Days)

AC-8 (1-2 Weeks/ 30 Days)

AC-9 (1-2 Weeks/ 30 Days)

AC-10 (1-2 Weeks/ 30 Days)

AC-11 (8-9 Weeks/ 30 Days)

$7,187.76 NO BID $8,643.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7,187.76 

LS-10

National Tellaro 

(Much smaller than BOD - 

67 1/8"W)

(4-6 Weeks/Limited 

Lifetime)

(84"W - Continuous 
cushion)

(50 Days/12 Yr)

Source International Lore 
Three Seat Sofa (85"W - 
Individual cushions w/ 

gaps between)
(5-6 Weeks/Limited 

Lifetime)

OFS - Rowen Sofa w/ 
Arms (84"W - Individual 

cushions w/ gaps between)
(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

LS-11

National Tellaro 

(4-6 Weeks/Limited 

Lifetime)

`

(Continuous cushion)
(50 Days/12 Yr)

Source International Lore 
Club Chair

(5-6 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime)

OFS - Rowen Lounge w/ 
Arms

(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

$4,330.99 NO BID $9,357.04 $7,409.15  $5,671.77 NO BID NO BID $9,357.04

AC-12

Low Bid is Basis of Design

$1,789.00 $2,215.00 $1,760.00 $1,851.15 $1,799.40 $2,128.04 NO BID $1,760.00

Section 13 - Demco

Library Quiet Double-Sided End of 
Range Book Truck

Section Total
Section 14 - Geiger

Wood Base Sofa

Alllmakes Item is significanly shorter than BOD

Saxton and Story Kenworthy Items use multiple cushions

Users requested single cushion to reduce conditions

where debris would accumulate

Appearance of OFS Item is not as close to BOD as Saxton 

Item

Wood Base Club Chair

Section Total

Low Bid is Basis of Design

Library Quiet Double-Sided End of 
Range Book Truck

Library Quiet Double-Sided End of 
Range Book Truck

Library Quiet Double-Sided End of 
Range Book Truck

Library Quiet Double-Sided End of 
Range Book Truck

Library Quiet Double-Sided End of 
Range Book Truck

Section 15 - Gressco

Rainbow Square Reading Seat 
Cushion Set

Section Total



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

(4-6 Weeks/Limited 
Lifetime)

(2 Days/Lifetime) (3 Weeks/Lifetime)
(6 Weeks/ Limited 

Lifetime)
(4-6 Weeks/Lifetime)

AC-4 Motivate Stacking Cart
Sit-On-It - Wire Stacking 

Cart
Sit-On-It - Wire Rod 

Stacking Cart

Sit-On-It - Stack Cart

CH-2

Motivate Side Chair - Poly, 
Upholstered Seat + 

Casters 

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

CH-3

Motiavte Side Chair - Poly

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

CH-4

Motivate Side Chair - Poly, 
Casters

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

CH-5

Motivate Side Chair - Poly 
with Arms + Casters

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

Sit-On-It - Lumin Four Leg 
Chair

CH-6

Motivate Conference Chair - 
Poly with Arms, 

Upholstered Seat

Sit-On-It - Lumin Light 
Task Chair Fixed Arms

Sit-On-It - Lumin Light 
Task Chair Fixed Arms

Sit-On-It - Lumin Light 
Task Chair Fixed Arms

CH-7

Motivate Wire Stacker 
(Stacks 12-High on Floor, 

40-High on Cart)

Sit-On-It - On Call Side 
Chair (Stacks 8-High on 
Floor, 25-High on Cart)

Sit-On-It - On Call Side 
Chair (Stacks 8-High on 
Floor, 25-High on Cart)

Stacks 10-High on Floor, 
30-High on Cart

Sit-On-It - On Call Side 
Chair (Stacks 8-High on 
Floor, 25-High on Cart)

Section 16 - Haworth

Item from HON is not equal to appearance of BOD

Lumin items are close match for appearance

However, the stacking ability is very low requiring over 

double the amount of storage space

For low differnce in cost between Lumin and BOD, the 

savings of storage space outweighs the cost savings.

Furthermore, the low bid for the tables where many of these 

chairs are stationed

is from this manufacterer which adds value to the Library in 

matching finishes.

Wire Stacking Cart

Very Side Chair - Perforated, 
Upholstered Seat + Casters 

Very Side Chair - Perforated

Very Side Chair - Perforated, Casters

Very Side Chair - Perforated with 
Arms + Casters

Very Conference Chair - Perforated 
with Arms, Upholstered Seat

Very Wire Stacker



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

Alternate: Sit-On-It - Lumin 
Wire Rod  Stacker (Stacks 
8-High on Floor, 15-High 

on Cart - More carts would 
be needed)

Alternate: Sit-On-It - Lumin 
Wire Rod  Stacker (Stacks 
8-High on Floor, 15-High 

on Cart - More carts would 
be needed)

Alternate: Sit-On-It - Lumin 
Wire Rod Stacker (Stacks 

8-High on floor, 15-High on 
Cart - Additional carts are 
included in revised pricing)

S-2

Motivate Bar Height Side 
Stool - Poly Back

Sit-On-It - Lumin Bar Stool Sit-On-It - Lumin Bar Stool

Sit-On-It - Lumin Bar Stool

S-3

Motivate Counter Height 
Side Stool - Poly Back

Sit-On-It - Lumin Counter 
Stool

Sit-On-It - Lumin Counter 
Stool

Sit-On-It - Lumin Counter 
Stool

$52,295.11 NO BID $76,888.98 $79,338.95 $78,039.66 $78,399.72 $74,381.12 $78,399.72Section Total

Very Bar Height Side Stool - 
Perforated Back

Very Counter Height Side Stool - 
Perforated Back



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

TA-4

(6-8 Weeks/12 Yr) Low Bid is Basis of Design

$4,450.60 NO BID $4,614.32 $3,256.52  $3,836.11 NO BID $2,509.90 $2,509.90

CH-8

(20 Day/12 Yr)

S-4

(20 Day/12 Yr)

S-5

(20 Day/12 Yr)

S-6

(20 Day/12 Yr)

S-7

(20 Day/12 Yr)

S-8

(20 Day/12 Yr)

NO BID NO BID $2,851.50 NO BID $2,991.43 NO BID NO BID $2,851.50

Section 17 - HBF

Parker Square Coffee Table

Section Total
Section 18A - Herman Miller

Section Total

Eames Molded Plastic Side Chair

Low Bid is Basis of Design

Eames Molded Plastic Barstool

Eames Molded Plastic Barstool

Eames Molded Plastic Barstool

Eames Molded Plastic Barstool

Eames Molded Plastic Barstool



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

TA-8

$4,597.20
(25-40 Days/12 Yr)

No Bid

 Haworth Collaborate 
Ellipse Table

$3,632.82 
(Smaller Ellipse Shape, 

includes White Gioia 
Marble Top)

(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

NO BID NO BID $4,597.20 NO BID $6,554.44 $3,632.82 NO BID $4,597.20

TA-14

$11,033.68
(25-30 Days/12 Yr)

OFS Applause Table, Flip 
Top, 72" x 24"

$11,435.34
(6 Week/ 12 Yr) Haworth Jive Training 

Flip/Nesting Table
$12,132.45

(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

NO BID NO BID $11,033.68 $13,486.38 $11,950.38 $12,132.45 NO BID $11,033.68

TA-15

$1,701.64
(25-30 Days/12 Yr)

OFS Applause Arc 
Segment Top

$1,601.04
(6 Week/ 12 Yr) Haworth Jive Training 

Table
$1,863.72

(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

NO BID NO BID $1,701.64 $1,601.04 $1,646.30 $1,863.72 NO BID $1,701.64
NO BID NO BID $12,735.32 $15,087.42 $13,596.68 $17,628.99 NO BID $12,735.32
NO BID NO BID $17,332.52 $13,486.38  $20,151.12 $17,628.99 NO BID $17,332.52

BE-2

(6-8 Weeks/ 3 Yr) OFS- Coact Bench Single 
(28"D)

(6 Weeks/12 Yr)
HPFI Eve Series

(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

BE-3 (6-8 Weeks/ 3 Yr)
OFS- Coact Bench Triple

(28"D)
(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

HPFI Eve Series
(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

BE-4 (6-8 Weeks/ 3 Yr)
OFS- Coact Bench Double

(28"D)
(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

HPFI Eve Series
(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

BE-5 (6-8 Weeks/ 3 Yr)
OFS- Coact Bench Single

(28"D)
(6 Weeks/12 Yr)

HPFI Eve Series
(6 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

$11,979.85 NO BID $13,941.07 NO BID $7,844.55 $11,963.78 NO BID $11,979.85

Section 18B - Herman Miller

Eames Coffee Table

BOD is low bid for the training tables

(Corner unit TA-15 must be from same provider as TA-14)

Item from Triplett is much smaller than BOD and

does not look the same

TA-8 Sub-Total

Everywhere Flip-Top Rectangular 
Table

Everywhere Conference Corner Table

Section Total

TA-14 & TA-15 Total
Section Total

Section 19 - Hightower

Story Low Short Bench

Low Bid Substitution is Recommended

Story Low Long Bench

Story Low Medium Bench

Story Low Short Bench



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

CH-12

Via Seating Bergan Mid-
Back

$10,652.00 (Does not meet 
aesthetic)

(3-4 Weeks/12 Yr)

$9,532.30
(6-8 Weeks/10 Yr)

CH-13

Via Seating Bergan High-
Back

$1,470.61  (Does not meet 
aesthetic)

(3-4 Weeks/12 Yr)

$1,016.65
(6-8 Weeks/10 Yr)

LS-1

9to5 Seating Lily Lounge
$7,456.90

(4-5 Weeks/Lifetime)

$9,110.88
(6-8 Weeks/10 Yr)

LS-5

9to5 Seating Lily Lounge
$13,948.64

(4-5 Weeks/Lifetime)

$13,810.72
(6-8 Weeks/10 Yr)

S-9

Muuto Fiber Counter Stool
$3,844.38

(9-10 Weeks/5 Yrs)

$4,170.00
(6-8 Weeks/10 Yr)

Section 20 - Keilhauer

Vanilla Mid-Back

Low bid for Council Chairs is BOD

Vanilla High-Back

Ponder Low Back Lounge Chair with 4-
Star Base

Saxton Items do not  quite match BOD appearance

Warranty on Muto is half of BOD

Legs of Chairs and Tables do not match up very close

Ponder Low Back Lounge Chair with 
Sled Base

Ponder Counter Stool with 4-Leg 
Wood Base



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch$25,249.92 $27,091.60 $27,091.60

TA-1

Knoll Dividends Horizon - 
30" Round Table

$3,188.57 
(Painted Silver Base)
(4-5 Weeks/Lifetime)

$4,507.16
(6-8 Weeks/10 Yr)

TA-2

Knoll Dividends Horizon - 
36" Round Table

$464.01 
(Painted Silver Base)
(4-5 Weeks/Lifetime)

$725.68
(6-8 Weeks/10 Yr)

TA-3

Knoll Dividends Horizon - 
30" x 30" Square Table

$1,805.64 
(Painted Silver Base)
(4-5 Weeks/Lifetime)

$2,595.92
(6-8 Weeks/10 Yr)

$5,458.22 $7,828.76 $7,828.76
$45,689.51 $56,021.00 $49,006.92 $42,830.75  $48,023.30 NO BID $45,469.31 $45,469.31

LS-1, LS-5, S-9 Sub-Totals

Juxta Lounge Height Table - 30"Dia.

Chairs of this section and these tables go together

in many locations

Legs of Knoll Dividends tables do not complement

chairs as well as the BOD.

Paint finish on Knoll Dividends will not match chairs

Best overall value to Owner is to bundle all of these items 

under one vendor.

Juxta Occasional Height Table - 
36"Dia.

Juxta Lounge Height Table - 30"x30"

TA-1, TA-2, TA-3 Sub-Totals
Section Total



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

AC-13

FLO Monitor Arm Kit
(20 Day/12 Yr)

(3 Week/ 10 Yr)

Ergotron LX Monitor Arm
(6 Weeks/ Limited 

Lifetime)

AC-14

FLO Monitor Arm Kit

Ergotron LX Monitor Arm

AC-15

FLO Dual Monitor Arm Kit

Ergotron LX Dual Monitor 
Arm

BC-1

Herman Miller Tu (shorter)
(20-30 Days/12 Yr)

(4-5 Weeks/ Lifetime)

Haworth X-Series
(8 Weeks/ Limited 

Lifetime)

PF-1

Canvas Office Landscape 
Mobile B/F Pedestal 

(20 7/8”H x 18"D B/F)

14 7/8"W x 16 3/4"D x 26 
3/8"H  

Haworth X-Series (18"D)

PF-2

Tu Metal Storage Mobile 
B/B/F Pedestal

(27 5/8” H)

14 7/8"W x 22 3/4"D x 26 
3/8"H  

Haworth X-Series

OF-1

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Storage + Everywhere 

Table + Motia HA Table
(25-30 Day/ 12 Yr - 5 Yr 

Height Adjustable)

Haworth Unigroup Too + X-
Series + Jive + Hop

OF-2

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Storage + Nevi HA 

Table
Haworth Unigroup Too + X-

Series + Hop + Belong

OF-3

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Storage + Renew HA 
Table + Ghent Aria glass 

board
(25-30 Day/ 12 Yr)

(7-8 Weeks/ Lifetime)
Haworth Masters Series + 

Compose/X-Series (HA 
Table 36"x78")

OF-4

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Storage + Renew HA 
Table + Ghent Aria glass 

board

Haworth Masters Series + 
Compose/X-Series (HA 

Table 36"x78")

SC-2

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Common Top (Metal 

Doors + Laminate Top - 
72"W x 20"D x 25 7/8”H 

with a 1 ¼” top.)

(4-5 Weeks/ Lifetime)

Haworth Planes/Beside 
(Laminate Sliding Doors)

SC-3

Tu Metal Storage
(26"H x 20"D)

Haworth X-Series

Low Bid Substitution from Pigott is acceptable

Sapper Monitor Arm Kit

Sapper Monitor Arm Kit

Calibre Bookcase

Series 2 - Mobile B/B/F Pedestal

Series 2 - Mobile B/B/F Pedestal

Private Office 1

Private Office 2

Private Office 3

Private Office 4

Template Storage Credenza

Antenna Credenza

Section 21A - Knoll

Sapper Monitor Arm Kit
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Section 8 - 3Branch

SC-4

Tu Wood Storage 
(27 ¼” H with 1 ¼” top. x 

20"D)

Haworth X-Series

SC-5

Tu Lateral + Tu Bookcase 
+ Laminate Surround

(25-35 Day/ 12 Yr)

Haworth X-Series

SC-6

Tu Lateral Files + Common 
Top

Haworth X-Series

SC-7

Tu Storage + Tu Lateral 
Files + Common Top 

Haworth X-Series

SC-8

Tu Storage (38"H., Metal 
Doors/Case)

(20-30 Day/ 12 Yr)

Sliding Locking Frosted 
Glass Doors

Haworth Planes/Beside 
(1/2 Sliding Door/ 1/2 Std. 

Doors in Laminate)

SC-10

Tu Storage (38"H., Metal 
Doors/Case)

Sliding Locking Frosted 
Glass Doors/Open 

Bookcase

Haworth Planes (All 
Laminate)

Antenna Credenza

Calibre Storage + Laminate Surround

Calibre Storage + Laminate Top

Calibre Storage + Laminate Top

Template Storage Credenza

Template Storage Credenza
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Section 8 - 3Branch

WS-1

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Pedestal

(25-30 Day/ 12 Yr - 5 Yr 
Height Adjustable)

Haworth Unigroup Too + X-
Series Storage (Basefeed 

is 3 circuit)

WS-2

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Pedestal + Nevi HA 

Table
Haworth Unigroup Too + X-

Series Storage 

WS-3

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Pedestal + Nevi HA 

Table

Haworth Hop Series + X-
Series Storage + Unigroup 

Too 

WS-4

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Pedestal + Nevi HA 

Table

Haworth Hop Series + X-
Series Storage + Unigroup 

Too 

WS-5

Canvas Office Landscape 
+ Tu Pedestal + Nevi HA 

Table

Haworth Hop Series + X-
Series Storage + Unigroup 

Too 

WS-6

Canvas Office Landscape
(25-30 Day/ 12 Yr) Haworth Unigroup Too + X-

Series Storage 

NO BID NO BID $70,832.93 $84,340.93  $86,153.72 $74,548.53 NO BID $84,340.93

Workstation 1

Workstation 2

Workstation 3

Workstation 4

Workstation 5

Workstation 6

Section Total
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Section 8 - 3Branch

TA-16
Everywhere Table

(20-30 Days/ 12 Yr)

(7-8 Weeks/ 10 Yr) Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

(6 Weeks/ Limited 
Lifetime)

TA-17
Everywhere Table (Sizing 

is different) 
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-18 Everywhere Table
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-19 Everywhere Table
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-20
Eames Table

(25-40 Days/ 12 Yr)
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-21
Eames Table 

(Cutouts/Power)
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-22 Eames Table
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-23
Eames Table 

(Cutouts/Power)
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-24
Eames Table 

(Cutouts/Power)
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-25
Eames Table 

(Cutouts/Power)
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

TA-26
Eames Table 

(Cutouts/Power)
Haworth Planes Table 
(Rectangular leg type)

Section 21B - Knoll

Reff Profiles Table with Column Legs - 
42"Dia.

With the exception of items TA-27 & TA-28

the substitution from Triplett appears to match closely to the 

BOD

Furthermore, the package for the chairs used at these tables 

would be from the same manufacturer

Reff Profiles Table with Soft 
Rectangular Legs - 60"x30"

Reff Profiles Table with Soft 
Rectangular Legs - 60"x30" Power

Reff Profiles Table with 2x4 Legs - 
72"x36"

Reff Profiles Table with 2x4 Legs - 
72"x42" Power

Reff Profiles Table with 2x4 Legs - 
78"x36" Grommets + Wire 

Management

Reff Profiles Table with 2x4 Legs - 
84"x36"

Reff Profiles Table with 2x4 Legs - 
96"x36" Power

Reff Profiles Table with 2x4 Legs - 
120"x60" Power

Reff Profiles Table with 4x4 Legs - 
144"x48" Power

Reff Profiles Table with 4x4 Legs - 
216"x60" Power



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

TA-27
Eames Table (Segmented 

Base)

(4-5 Weeks/ 10 Yr)
$1207.91

Haworth Pop Up Table 
$1440.12

TA-28
Eames Table (Segmented 

Base)
$1,277.21

Haworth Pop Up Table 
(Maximum width is 72"W.)

$15101.98

TA-29 Layout Studio

Haworth Belong/Intuity 
(Infeed is 3 circuit)

TA-30 Layout Studio
Haworth Belong/Intuity 

(Infeed is 3 circuit)

NO BID NO BID $2,485.12 $44,696.90 NO BID
NO BID NO BID $60,743.62 $68,494.49   $83,873.69 $47,639.00 NO BID $68,494.49

CH-1

(3-4 Weeks/ 12 Yr) HON Ignition 2.0 Low-Back 
ReActiv

(3-4 Weeks/ Lifetime)

S-1

(3-4 Weeks/ 12 Yr) HON Ignition 2.0 ReActiv 
Stool

(3-4 Weeks/ Lifetime)

With the exception of items 
TA-27 & TA-28

The substitution appears to 
match the BOD.

$11,583.36 NO BID $10,854.60 $10,830.27 $8,250.99 $12,577.82 $10,830.27

Antenna Counter Height Table - 
78"x24"

Antenna Big Table - Benching - 
Grouping of 6

Antenna Big Table - Benching - 
Grouping of 12

Recommended Bids
Section Total

Section 21C - Knoll

Antenna Counter Height Table - 
60"x24"

ReGeneration Task Chair

This package needs additional evaluation

ReGeneration High Task Chair

Section Total



ANKENY KIRKENDALL PUBLIC LIBRARY 10/1/2019

FURNITURE BID TAB

100 Court Ave., Suite 100

Des Moines, IA 50309

Item Code Allmakes LFI Pigott Saxton Storey Kenworthy Triplett Workspace BOD Bid COMMENTSItem Description

Section 8 - 3Branch

LS-2

HAY About A Lounge 
(Approx. 16"SH) (Wood 

Base - COM's not 
available)

(6-8 Weeks/ 2 Yr)

(5-6 Weeks/ 12 Yr) 
(17.5"SH)

Encore Melina High Back 
Lounge Chair (16.75"SH) 
(Metal 4-Star base style - 
aesthetic does not match) 
(8 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

LS-3

HAY About A Lounge 
(Wood Base - COM's not 

available)
(6-8 Weeks/ 2 Yr)

(5-6 Weeks/ 12 Yr) 
(17.5"SH)

Encore Melina Mid Back 
Lounge Chair  (16.75"SH) 
(Metal 4-Star base style - 
aesthetic does not match) 
(8 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

LS-4

HAY About A Lounge 
(Wood Base - COM's not 

available) 
(6-8 Weeks/ 2 Yr)

(5-6 Weeks/ 12 Yr) 
(17.5"SH)

Encore Melina Mid Back 
Lounge Chair  (16.75"SH) 
(Metal 4-Star base style - 
aesthetic does not match) 
(8 Weeks/Limited Lifetime)

NO BID NO BID $26,864.16 $45,192.28 NO BID $22,450.24 NO BID $45,192.28

Section 21D - Knoll

Rockwell Unscripted High Back 
Lounge Chair

Appearance of Substitutions differ greatly from BOD

Some substitutions can't be obtained in the specified finishes

Pigott items have a much lower warrenty

This is the basic paton seating lounge chair group

The appearance and comfort of the seated paton was 

evaluated extensively prior to bids.

Design Professionals believe the BOD is the only item that 

matches all requirements

Rockwell Unscripted Club Chair

Rockwell Unscripted Club Chair

Section Total
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Section 8 - 3Branch

CH-9

(4-6 Weeks/ 5 Yr)

CH-10

(4-6 Weeks/ 5 Yr)

CH-11

(4-6 Weeks/ 5 Yr)

TA-12

(4-6 Weeks/ 5 Yr)

$12,346.70 NO BID $13,257.60 $12,244.96  $12,828.91 $12,532.50 $12,961.97 $12,244.96

LS-21

(8-9 Weeks/ 10 Yr)

LS-22

(8-9 Weeks/ 10 Yr)

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,590.92 NO BID NO BID $3,590.92

LS-12

(4-6 Weeks/ 12 Yr)

TA-7

(4-6 Weeks/ 12 Yr)

$3,112.83 NO BID $2,718.24  $2,743.32 $2,794.41 $3,103.00 $2,608.32 $2,608.32

Section Total
Section 23 - NorvaNivel

Grassyott Ottoman - Small

Low Bid is Basis of Design

Grassyott Ottoman - Medium

Section Total

Section 22 - Leland International

Little Marquette Side Chair

Low Bid is Basis of Design

Little Marquette Side Chair

Little Marquette Side Chair

Little Marquette Table

Section 24 - OFS

Boost Round Ottoman with 
Removable Top

Low Bid is Basis of Design

Kintra Counter Height Table

Section Total
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Section 8 - 3Branch

AC-3

(4-6 Weeks/ 3 Yr)

AC-5

(4-6 Weeks/ 3 Yr)

 $4,105.43 NO BID $4,143.84 NO BID $3,984.34 $4,045.81 NO BID 3984.34

LS-6

(5 Weeks/5 Yr) Low Bid is Basis of Design

$5,424.56 NO BID $5,805.52 NO BID  $6,010.48 NO BID NO BID $5,424.56

LS-16

DWR Drum Pouf  
$2,132.90 (12"H. - No 

COM's - Only available in 3 
felt colors)

(20 Day/ 2 Yr)

EKO H@KR Ottoman 
$2,435.63
(16.25"H)

(6 Weeks/Lifetime)

$2,560.32 (16"H)
(4-6 Week/ Limited 

Lifetime)

LS-17

DWR Drum Pouf $609.40
(12"H. - No COM's - Only 
available in 3 felt colors)

(20 Day/ 2 Yr)

EKO H@KR Ottoman 
$776.61

(6 Weeks/Lifetime)

$757.92
 (16"H) (4-6 Week/ Limited 

Lifetime)

LS-18

DWR Drum Pouf $304.70
(12"H. - No COM's - Only 
available in 3 felt colors)

(20 Day/ 2 Yr)

EKO H@KR Ottoman 
$427.47

(6 Weeks/Lifetime)

$377.78
 (16"H) (4-6 Week/ Limited 

Lifetime)

NO BID NO BID $3,887.00  $3,639.71  $11,274.20 NO BID $3,696.02 $3,696.02

TA-10

HMI Polygon Table 
$840.00 (20"H. x 18"W. -
Table Height Too Low) 

(20 Day/ 2 Yr)

No Bid

$1064.20
(22.5" x 25"Dia.) (4-6 

Week/ Limited Lifetime)

Pigott Item is very different from BOD

BOD vendor has best overall package deal

NO BID NO BID $3,887.00  $11,274.20 NO BID $4,760.22 $4,760.22

Vendor Totals: $25,678.70 $15,923.00 $119,659.66 $60,979.70 $39,273.18 $126,719.66 $55,347.75 $443,581.65

# Pakages 4 1 6 4 6 3 4

NOTE:  BOD = "Basis of Design"

Low Bid is Basis-of-Design, (Represented with dashed blue outlines)

Alternate Submitted

Alternate Submitted, bid is higher than BOD

Recommended Award to a Substitution

$0.00 Lowest Bid - Alternate, Not Recommended - (Does not meet specifications or appearance expectations)

MeetUp Easel

Low Bid is Basis of Design

Reform Trash and Recycling 
Receptacle

Section Total
Section 26 - Sixinch

Livv Lounge Chair

Section 25 - Peter Pepper Products

Section Sub-Total

Campfire Paper Table with Glass

Section Total

Section Total
Section 27 - Turnstone

Campfire Ottoman

Pigott Items do not match specified finishes and are very 

limited in finish options

Saxton Items are less than $100 differnce from BOD and 

Didn't price a table

Best value to Library is BOD

Campfire Ottoman

Campfire Ottoman
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Section 8 - 3Branch

Vendor Totals: $25,678.70 $15,923.00 $119,659.66 $60,979.70 $39,273.18 $126,719.66 $55,347.75 $443,581.65
# Pakages 4 1 6 4 6 3 4

SUMMARY:

Budget: $491,092.00
Bids on BOD $498,496.34

Value of Recommended Bids: $443,581.65

Savings to Date $47,510.35


